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Often regarded as the greatest German poet of the twentieth century, Rainer Maria Rilke (1875–1926)
remains one of the most influential figures of European modernism. In this Companion, leading scholars
offer informative and thought-provoking essays on his life and social context, his correspondence, all his
major collections of poetry including most famously the Duino Elegies and Sonnets to Orpheus, and his
seminal novel of Modernist anxiety, The Notebooks of Malte Laurids Brigge. Rilke's critical contexts are
explored in detail: his relationship with philosophy and the visual arts, his place within modernism and his
relationship to European literature, and his reception in Europe and beyond. With its invaluable guide to
further reading and a chronology of Rilke's life and work, this Companion will provide an accessible,
engaging account of this extraordinary poet whose legacy looms so large today.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Naylor:

With other case, little men and women like to read book The Cambridge Companion to Rilke (Cambridge
Companions to Literature). You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. So long as we know
about how is important a book The Cambridge Companion to Rilke (Cambridge Companions to Literature).
You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because
from book you can recognize everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you may be
known. About simple thing until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In this era, we can easily open a
book or searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to the
library. Let's go through.

Eric Ray:

Now a day folks who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources included can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Cambridge Companion to
Rilke (Cambridge Companions to Literature) book because this book offers you rich details and knowledge.
Of course the data in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Damon Smith:

Typically the book The Cambridge Companion to Rilke (Cambridge Companions to Literature) will bring
that you the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique.
When you try to find new book you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book The Cambridge
Companion to Rilke (Cambridge Companions to Literature) is much recommended to you to learn. You can
also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Geneva Orta:

The actual book The Cambridge Companion to Rilke (Cambridge Companions to Literature) has a lot of
knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was
authored by the very famous author. The author makes some research previous to write this book. This book
very easy to read you can get the point easily after perusing this book.
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