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“Chords For Guitar is written in a concise and clear manner that will be easy to understand by anyone with
basic music knowledge. A consistent and simple approach that will prove to be a great tool for those hoping
to expand their knowledge on the fret-board.” Danny McCrum - Professional Guitarist (New Zealand)

“Gareth Evan's guitar chord book is one of the most thorough and in-depth books I have ever seen. If you're
armed with one of these books, you will have everything you will ever require to know all about chords.”
Tony Cox - Award winning Acoustic guitarist (South Africa)

Chords for Guitar is about moveable chord shapes based on the CAGED guitar system. Rather than
presenting the same shapes for the same chord types as different chords when moved up or down the fret-
board, giving 1000’s of chords, Chords for Guitar makes this into a simple unified process by showing only
the moveable shapes and how to move them up or down the fret-board, allowing for more chord types.

Chord Reference - Chords for Guitar is a reference of over 200 unique shapes for just over 60 different
chord types, from the commonly used chord types such as major, minor, sus2, sus4, add9 and 7th chords to
further extended chords, altered chords and inversions, enabling you to find many more chords yourself and
get a better understanding of the fret-board.

Questions and Answers - The root note location within all of the guitar chords is clearly marked out,
enabling you to transpose its moveable shape up and down the fret-board. Each chord type has a question to
make sure you’re on track to being able to locate guitar chords yourself; shift the root note to its note name
location (e.g. C, F#, G etc.) apply the chord shape, then check the answer at the back.

Theory - Theory and chord construction are explained using piano keys for the simplicity of its linear layout
of notes, then applied to the six-string guitar, from the basics of using odd numbered intervals (e.g. 1, 3, 5
etc.) to the compound intervals within extended chords and alterations.

Grab a copy today!

“I had wanted to start playing less with a capo, and more with an ability to transpose chords just by being
more familiar with the fret board in it's entirety. This book teaches you exactly this. Highly recommended.”
Rebecca Cullen, Performing Musician & Composer (UK)



“At the School of Guitar we always use the CAGED system but we have never seen it applied so well to all
chords. I love the way each transposable version of the chord is linked to an open chord. Simply the best
book of chords we have seen.” Cormac O Caoimh, School of Guitar (Ireland)

“For those students of guitar who are looking for an explanation of this famed system of learning the guitar
fretboard, in a relatively fast, painfree and efficient manner, this is a wonderful book. You will find many
subtle chords that you hadn't expected were easily movable.”  Marion Arts – Guitar Teacher, Performer
& Composer (New Zealand)
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Palmer:

Book is usually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication Chords for Guitar: Transposable
Guitar Chords using the CAGED System will make you to always be smarter. You can feel much more
confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you think this open or reading a book make you
bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or suitable
book with you?

Rodolfo Odum:

The e-book with title Chords for Guitar: Transposable Guitar Chords using the CAGED System posesses a
lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. This specific book
exist new understanding the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the world right
now. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you
in new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read this
anywhere you want.

Rick Fairchild:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you could have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Chords for Guitar:
Transposable Guitar Chords using the CAGED System, it is possible to enjoy both. It is excellent
combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind
hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Grace Smith:

Book is one of source of knowledge. We can add our information from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the
world. By the book Chords for Guitar: Transposable Guitar Chords using the CAGED System we can take
more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To be creative person must like to read a book. Merely
choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book
Chords for Guitar: Transposable Guitar Chords using the CAGED System. You can more attractive than
now.
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