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The reply of Maximilian to the wealthy courtier who tendered him a goodly purse of gold for a title of
nobility, was worthy of that emperor: “I can enrich thee,” he said, “but only thy own virtue can enoble thee”
All true grandeur, excellence, and dignity, are the offspring of virtue. Even the most renowned oracles of
paganism proclaim this, and the very persecutors of holiness are often constrained to pay homage to their
victim. No wonder, then, that whenever we are privileged to find one of those rare mortals, whom virtue has
unmistakably marked as her own, we lovingly attach an exceptional importance to everything connected with
his history. Such assuredly was he whose “account of what befel” him during his first ten years in America,
is now for the first time published in English. A brief sketch of the religious Order to which he belonged, of
the life he led, and of the Monastery he founded, may give added interest to his own simple and edifying
narrative. What Scripture terms “the world,” and so emphatically denounces as such, is the poisonous source
of the mOther-evils described by St. John as “the concupiscence of the flesh, and the concupiscence of the
eyes, and the pride of life.” Flight from the contamination of this threefold inordinate love of pleasures,
riches and honors, being essential to salvation, is most easily, most surely and most meritoriously achieved
by those who, in answer to a Divine call, consecrate and give themselves wholly to God, by the practice of
the evangelical counsels of chastity, poverty and obedience. Those who embrace this angelic profession form
the choice portion of the fold of Christ. They rank as His spouses, and, by the holy ambition of their virgin
love, console Him for the craven defections or the cold indifference of so many Christians. All Christians
animated by the spirit of Jesus are religious, just as they are holy, and kings and priests (I Peter 2,9). Such is
the unity of the marvellous body of Christ, the Church, whose soul is infinite love, that her every member
shares, in some sense and measure, all her sublime prerogatives. But as God willed that in His family some
goods should be common to all, so He likewise decreed that Other goods should be reserved to
comparatively few, and through these chosen and privileged ones benefit the rest. Hence, as besides this
elementary royalty and priesthood conferred by baptism, there are, according to the express order of God
superior and official royalties and priesthoods, in like manner besides the fundamental religion, which is the
vital breath of every soul in a state of grace, there is a religion more eminent, more definite, more perfect.
Thus as there is here below a sacerdotal and royal state, so likewise is there a religious state which is
confined to those only who bind themselves by vows to a monastic life. It is evident, therefore, that when
Catholics use the expression “religious Order,” or term a monk or nun “a religious,” they are perfectly
justified in doing so, the cavillings of Dr. Trench to the contrary notwithstanding. Each religious order is
characterized by the special purpose for which it was founded, and by the constitution and rule which its
members are to follow.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Foland:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Memoir. You can choose the best book if you appreciate
reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book Memoir. You can add information and of
course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know
everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple
point until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a book or searching by
internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's read.

Mary Larrick:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not demand people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to
be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book
can help persons out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Memoir book because book offers you rich
information and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no doubt in it as
you know.

John Olive:

This Memoir is great book for you because the content which is full of information for you who all always
deal with world and get to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it data accurately using
great manage word or we can say no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can
have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with splendid delivering sentences. Having Memoir in your hand like finding the world in your
arm, details in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no book that offer you world in ten or fifteen tiny
right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. busy do you
still doubt which?

Veda Howard:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything we want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This book Memoir was filled concerning science. Spend your free time to add your
knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has diverse feel when they reading some sort of
book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern
era like today, many ways to get book that you wanted.
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