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From Book 1: 4 ½ Stars TOP PICK --RT Magazine

"Best book of the year! Best new character of the year! Best new series all year! I. Loved. This. Book. You
gotta read it."

—Faith Hunter, New York Times Bestselling Author of the Jane Yellowrock series

"Diana Pharaoh Francis has crafted a winning paranormal mystery that mixes sizzling sex, magic, and a
decades old search for artifacts that could change their world."

—Jeanne Stein, Bestselling Author of The Anna Strong Chronicles

"Trace of Magic caught me up fast and pulled me in tight for a fun, action-and-sass adventure full of deadly
magic and dangerous romance. Diana Pharaoh Francis delivers a downright terrific read."

—Devon Monk, nationally Bestselling Author of Hell Bent

Even the most powerful tracers can't track you if the magical trace you leave behind is too old. But I can
track almost anything, even dead trace. That makes me a unicorn, the Tooth Fairy, the Easter Bunny, and the
Loch Ness Monster all rolled into one. In a word, I am unique. A very special snowflake. And if anyone ever
finds out, I'll be dead or a slave to one of the Tyet criminal factions.

Riley Hollis has quietly traced kidnapped children and quietly tipped the cops to their whereabouts one too
many times. Now she's on the radar of Detective Clay Price, a cop in the pocket of a powerful magic Tyet
faction. When he blackmails her into doing a dangerous trace for him, Riley will have to break every rule
that keeps her safe. Or become a Tyet pawn in a deadly, magical war.
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From reader reviews:

Kyle Guthrie:

The e-book with title The Diamond City Magic Novels (2 Book Series) contains a lot of information that you
can study it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you throughout new era
of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere
you want.

Charles Wagoner:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always try and and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely of
course. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity are there when the spare
time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading guides. It
can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the book you have read will be The
Diamond City Magic Novels (2 Book Series).

Laura Buscher:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This e-book The Diamond City Magic Novels (2 Book Series) was filled concerning
science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some
people has different feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big selling point of a book,
you can truly feel enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways to get book you wanted.

Loretta Jones:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or
even make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real
their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this The Diamond City Magic Novels (2 Book Series) can make you really feel more
interested to read.
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