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This is a text of local differential geometry considered as an application of advanced calculus and linear
algebra. The discussion is designed for advanced undergraduate or beginning graduate study, and presumes
of readers only a fair knowledge of matrix algebra and of advanced calculus of functions of several real
variables.
The author, who is a Professor of Mathematics at the Polytechnic Institute of New York, begins with a
discussion of plane geometry and then treats the local theory of Lie groups and transformation groups, solid
differential geometry, and Riemannian geometry, leading to a general theory of connections.
The author presents a full development of the Erlangen Program in the foundations of geometry as used by
Elie Cartan as a basis of modern differential geometry; the book can serve as an introduction to the methods
of E. Cartan. The theory is applied to give a complete development of affine differential geometry in two and
three dimensions.
Although the text deals only with local problems (except for global problems that can be treated by methods
of advanced calculus), the definitions have been formulated so as to be applicable to modern global
differential geometry. The algebraic development of tensors is equally accessible to physicists and to pure
mathematicians. The wealth of specific resutls and the replacement of most tensor calculations by linear
algebra makes the book attractive to users of mathematics in other disciplines.
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From reader reviews:

Rolando Gil:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't want do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Differential Geometry
(Dover Books on Mathematics). All type of book would you see on many options. You can look for the
internet options or other social media.

Andrea Toliver:

This Differential Geometry (Dover Books on Mathematics) is brand new way for you who has curiosity to
look for some information as it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you onto it getting
knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Differential
Geometry (Dover Books on Mathematics) can be the light food to suit your needs because the information
inside this particular book is easy to get by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which is reachable
by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book form. People who think that in e-book form make them feel tired
even dizzy this book is the answer. So you cannot find any in reading a book especially this one. You can
find actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss it! Just read this e-book variety for
your better life in addition to knowledge.

Kristy Lange:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more important
than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you must do
is just spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in the
top record in your reading list will be Differential Geometry (Dover Books on Mathematics). This book that
is certainly qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking
way up and review this book you can get many advantages.

Michael Lockwood:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book has been rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but additionally novel and Differential Geometry (Dover Books on
Mathematics) or even others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the fantastic a
book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students
especially. Those books are helping them to bring their knowledge. In different case, beside science
publication, any other book likes Differential Geometry (Dover Books on Mathematics) to make your spare
time more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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