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A gripping inside look at high-stakes lawyering, A Patent Lie is further evidence that Paul Goldstein is an
emerging master of the legal thriller.After being forced from his high-powered Manhattan law firm, Michael
Seeley—the tough-but-wounded hero of Errors and Omissions—has set up shop in his native Buffalo. Partly
out of need, partly out of pride, Seeley takes on a case for his estranged brother, whose small biotech firm is
suing a Swiss pharmaceutical giant over a controversial new AIDS vaccine. Seeley heads out to Silicon
Valley to lead the case, but soon realizes there is much more at stake than he was first led to believe. As
certain partnerships come to light, and financial gains become staggeringly clear, Seeley's own life may be in
grave danger.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Yolanda Osuna:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content.
As we know that book is very important for people. The book A Patent Lie has been making you to know
about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you. The guide
A Patent Lie is not only giving you much more new information but also to become your friend when you
experience bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your guide. Try to make relationship
using the book A Patent Lie. You never experience lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Arthur Reaves:

Often the book A Patent Lie will bring someone to the new experience of reading any book. The author style
to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to read, this book very acceptable to you. The
book A Patent Lie is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the official web
site, so you can easier to read the book.

Dana Richardson:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
lots of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity
are there when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, often the book
you have read will be A Patent Lie.

Mary Brott:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This publication A Patent Lie was filled about science. Spend your extra time
to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has different feel when they reading a
book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a publication. In the modern
era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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